From: Ron Hileman <ronhileman@gmail.com>  Sent: Friday, August 2, 2024 9:22 AM To: Robin Omeara <robinomeara@hgmetrodist.org>; Daniel Taylor <danieltaylor@hgmetrodist.org>; Rita Effler <ritaeffler@hgmetrodist.org>; Wendy Pfaffhausen <pfaffy1@msn.com>; Jan Belt <janetbelt4@gmail.com>; Wayne Warton <waynzworld@comcast.net>; Lary Herkal <lary.herkal@heathergardensmail.com>; Phil Hughes <phdenver@comcast.net> Cc: Juan Quintana <jcqn2470@gmail.com> Subject: Fwd: JCQN DESIGNS AND FENCE - ESTIMATE
 
Wendy and I met with Juan on Thursday, July 30 to go over our requirements for replacing the cloth nets with chain link fences.  Of course, HGMD will make the decision between purchasing cloth nets and chain link fences.
 
JCQN will cut six square holes in the 5" thick asphalt  and dig holes approximately 3 feet deep, keeping the asphalt  for later use.  They will fill the holes with concrete and will replace the asphalt flush with the court surface. The pole foundation will sustain wind loading with sind screens or noise barriers covering the fence.  The fences will have 4' openings on each side of the center bench to allow the tennis ball sweeper and players to go between courts.
 
We also showed Juan the west gate that is scraping the court.  He proposed unwelding the upper bracket on the gate and welding it in a new position so that the gate is raised.  I will ask Juan for a quote for doing this task.
 
Ron Hileman
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---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Juan Quintana <jcqn2470@gmail.com>
Date: Fri, Aug 2, 2024 at 8:42 AM
Subject: JCQN DESIGNS AND FENCE - ESTIMATE
To: Ron Hileman <ronhileman@gmail.com>
 
Hi Ron, good morning!
Thank you for taking a moment to meet with us yesterday  regarding your next fence project. Attached is the estimate for the job, please review carefully to make sure all information is correct.
If you wish to approve, all we require is a signed estimate in return to get started and to have utilities marked if necessary. We do not require downpayment or deposits, all payment is due after the completion of the job. This is to ensure your full satisfaction of the fence before submitting payment. 

If you have any questions or concerns, email us back or give us a call to: 720-245-1634 

Thank you, have a great day! 
 
 











 




om: Ron lran rooleman g com> Snt:Fride, A2, 024
9228 To: R Omera<rsbnomeara@gmetrodst o Dae Takor
<iamlylrBngmtrodo o s Eer s Gt
e ishosen A1 Brin o o Bt

Canabots gnai o Wapme Waron cuynawordBcomcast e
Ly rkl <y el hestergrdenst com; P s
<phdanr et o G Gt

<706 o> Sbject Pk CON DESGNS ANDFENCE

Wendy and | metwithJoamon Thrsday. Jly 010,00 v o
oquirements o raplacing e G nefswil chan ik fnces. 01
e HGMD wil s i Gocionbetween pschasing cioh s
and chai ik onces.

QN il cut s suaro hoes i th 5 thic ashalt and i hses
approamaley 3 ot deep, Kooing e asprat for e . They
W12 hoes wihconcite and i ropiace he asphal s wih
9o count sutace. The o foundaton whsusain wind 103 wih
sind scrons o noe barmrs Corering h ence. T fences il
Rave & openingson eachsdaof o comorbench 1 adow h s
ek wepar and payers o g bewoon cout.

We sl showed Juan th west gate that s sraping th cour. He
proposed waiin e uppor racelon th G e
e osiion 5 tha h gt s ried. | il 8k 4 or 8 que o
Going s sk

Ron Hieman



